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At Aloma Elementary, an electronic marquee sign replaced a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee was connected to the school via 
fiber optics in a project that concluded in October 2021. Exterior painting is scheduled to be complete by November 2023. One portable is 
expected to be removed by the end of 2023.

At Azalea Park Elementary, an electronic marquee sign will replace a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee will be connected to the 
school via fiber optics in a project concluding in December 2022. The exterior will be painted and should be completed by November 2023.

At Baldwin Park Elementary, an electronic marquee sign will replace a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee will be connected to the 
school via fiber optics in a project concluding in December 2022. The fire alarm, intercom, closed-captioning TV and intrusion-protection system 
is being replaced by December 2023. Renovation of the heating, ventilation and air conditioner system is scheduled to be completed by August 
2024. Two portables will be removed by the end of 2023.

At Brookshire Elementary, an electronic marquee sign will replace a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee will be connected to the 
school via fiber optics in a project concluding in March 2023. Five portables will be removed by the end of 2023.

At Cheney Elementary, an electronic marquee sign replaced a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee was connected to the school via 
fiber optics in a project that concluded in March 2022. 

At College Park Middle, an ADA accommodation was added in June 2022. A classroom addition is scheduled to start design in fall 2022 and is 
expected to be complete in 2024. Eighteen portables will be removed by the end of 2023.

At Dommerich Elementary, an electronic marquee sign will replace a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee will be connected to the 
school via fiber optics in a project concluding in March 2023. Interior painting campus-wide is scheduled to be complete by October 2023. The 
heating, ventilation, air conditioning, chiller replacement and other multi-systems should be complete by July 2024. Two portables will be 
removed by the end of 2023.

At Edgewater High, a new fuel tank was installed in August 2022. A freestanding announcer booth is scheduled to be installed on the softball 
fields by September 2022. The refurbishment of the cooling towers is scheduled to be complete by November 2022. A new water heater is 
scheduled to be installed by December 2022. Exterior painting should be complete by November 2023.

At the Exceptional Education Administration building, the heating, ventilation and air conditioning system will be refreshed, a sally port will 
be added, some piping and insulation will be replaced, building automation controls will be upgraded and the fire alarm, intercom and security 
system will be replaced in a project concluding in September 2023. 

At Evans High, a new fuel tank was installed in August 2022. The fire alarm, intercom, closed-captioning TV and intrusion-protection system is 
being replaced by December 2023. Replacing the heating, ventilation and air conditioning system in building 32 and exterior lighting with LED 
technology is scheduled to be complete by July 2023 and August 2023 respectively. Exterior painting should be complete by November 2023. 
Nine portables will be removed by the end of 2023.



A project at Glenridge Middle, including upgrades to LED lighting, improvements to elevator equipment and security systems, new intercom 
and fire alarm systems and replacements of select heating, ventilation and air conditioning system components were completed in August 
2022. Six portables will be removed by the end of 2023.

Howard Middle is on track for a comprehensive renovation that is expected to be complete in 2024. 

Hungerford ES Bldg. 8 (CTE welding lab) renovation project is in the design step with a projected construction start in October 2022 and 
completion in July 2023.

At Killarney Elementary, an electronic marquee sign replaced a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee was connected to the school via 
fiber optics in a project that concluded in March 2022. Chillers will be replaced by November 2024. The fire alarm, intercom, closed-captioning 
TV and intrusion-protection system is scheduled to be complete by December 2023. Interior painting is scheduled to be complete by October 
2023. Eleven portables will be removed by the end of 2023.

At Lake Silver Elementary, an electronic marquee sign will replace a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee will be connected to the 
school via fiber optics in a project concluding in December 2022. Interior painting is scheduled to be complete by December 2022.

At Lake Sybelia Elementary, an electronic marquee sign will replace a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee will be connected to the 
school via fiber optics in a project concluding in March 2023. Chillers will be replaced by October 2023. Exterior painting should be completed 
by November 2023.

At Lake Weston Elementary, an electronic marquee sign replaced a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee was connected to the school 
via fiber optics in a project that concluded in August 2022.

At Lakemont Elementary, an electronic marquee sign will replace a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee will be connected to the 
school via fiber optics in a project concluding in March 2023. A multi-system renewal project is scheduled to start in November 2023 and to be 
completed in November 2024. 

At Maitland Middle, the fire alarm, intercom, closed-captioning TV and intrusion-protection system is being replaced by December 2023. The 
replacement of air conditioning units at buildings 400 and 500 is scheduled for 2023 and 2024. Six portables will be removed by the end of 
2023.

At Meadowbrook Middle, the fire alarm, intercom, closed-captioning TV and intrusion-protection system is being replaced by December 2023. 
A multi-system project, including four buildings set to be reroofed should be complete by January 2024. 

A science lab portable was installed at the Orlando Gifted Academy in July 2022. Pine Hills Bus Compound, electric bus depot pilot project 
scheduled to start construction in September 2022 and complete by December 2022.

At Pinewood Elementary, an electronic marquee sign replaced a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee was connected to the school 
via fiber optics in a project that concluded in August 2022. The closed-captioning TV security cameras are scheduled to be replaced by August 
2023. Four portables will be removed by the end of 2023.

At Princeton Elementary, an electronic marquee sign replaced a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee was connected to the school 
via fiber optics in a project that will conclude in December 2022. The closed-captioning TV security cameras are scheduled to be replaced by 
August 2023. Exterior painting is scheduled to be completed by November 2023.

At Ridgewood Park Elementary, an electronic marquee sign replaced a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee was connected to the 
school via fiber optics in a project that concluded in August 2022. The fire alarm, intercom, closed-captioning TV and intrusion-protection 
system is scheduled to be replaced by December 2023. 

At Rosemont Elementary, an electronic marquee sign will replace a changeable letter marquee. The new marquee will be connected to the 
school via fiber optics in a project concluding in December 2022. An updated fire alarm system, building exterior repairs, improvements to the 
heating, ventilation and air conditioning system and new intercom call buttons and wiring are scheduled to be complete by June 2024. 

At Winter Park High, a comprehensive renovation is in design, with construction completion expected in July 2025. Improvements to the 
kitchen cooler and freezer are scheduled to be complete by July 2023. A fuel tank was installed in August 2022.


